
CITY OF IRVING, TEXAS

Bid Name: Microfilming Services
ITB Number: 019-10F
Due Date: October 27, 2009     
PURCHASING AGENT: Ed Matthews, Purchasing Manager, 972-721-2631

 

Type of camera used 16mm

Trype of camera used 35 mm

Type of silver film used 16mm

Type of  silver film used 35mm

Type of Silver deplicate film used 
16mm
Type of silver duplicate film used 
35mm
Type of Diazo used/roll
Type of Diazo/fiche

1 30 Prep 8.5 x 14 & smaller docs $50.00 $1,500.00 $12.13 $363.90 $25.00 $750.00 $26.00 $1,300.00
2 10 Prep oversized documents $60.00 $600.00 $28.00 $280.00 $37.50 $375.00 $35.00 $2,100.00
3 65,000 Film 16 mm $0.044 $2,860.00 $0.033 $2,112.50 $0.0372 $2,418.00 $0.0320 $0.00
4 2,000 Film 35 mm $0.35 $700.00 $0.73 $1,460.00 $0.053 $106.00 $0.550 $0.19
5 260 Silver dup 16mm x 100 ft $14.50 $3,770.00 $15.00 $3,900.00 $34.95 $9,087.00 $14.00 $203.00
6 10 35mm x 100 ft $21.25 $212.50 $16.51 $165.10 $49.92 $499.20 $19.50 $414.38
7 220 Jacket load & Label 16mm $245.44 $53,996.80 $25.60 $5,632.00 $1.09 $239.80 $38.50 $9,449.44
8 10 Jacket load & Label 35mm $6.00 $60.00 $35.75 $357.50 $1.24 $12.40 $38.50 $231.00
9 8,000 Green Stripe fiche $0.15 $1,200.00 $0.31 $2,480.00 $0.41 $3,280.00 $64.84 $9.73
10 1,000 White Stripe fiche $0.15 $150.00 $0.18 $179.00 $0.40 $400.00 $64.84 $9.73
11 50 Pick up charge $25.0000 $1,250.00 $15.000 $750.00 $15.00 $750.00 $100.00 $2,500.00
12 50 Delivery charge $25.00 $1,250.00 $15.00 $750.00 $15.00 $750.00 $0.00 $0.00

Subtotal $67,549.30 $18,430.00 $18,667.40 $16,217.46

Prep 8.5 x 14 & smaller docs $50.00 $10,000.00 $13.650 $2,730.00 $25.000 $5,000.00 No bid $0.00
Film 16 mm $0.074 $37,000.00 $0.051 $25,500.00 $0.049 $24,500.00 No bid $0.00
Pick up Charge $25.00 $1,250.00 $15.000 $750.00 $15.000 $750.00 No bid $0.00
Delivery Charge $25.00 $1,250.00 $15.000 $750.00 $15.000 $750.00 No bid $0.00
Set up Charge $250.00 $250.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 No bid $0.00
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RESPONSE SUMMARY

A.  Information and 
Unit Costs

Kodak Diazon

Data Management 
Internationale Inc.

Canon & Minolta

Kodak MRD (4) 10x-21x

16mmx100'Kodak 8223232 

16mmx1000'Kodak 1233006
105mmx1500'Exopac 22773

Precision Micrographics & 
Imaging, Inc.            

Minolta Planetary or 
Kodak Rotary

Kodak Planetary

VENDORS Digital Data Imaging

Canon Planetary Camera

Kodak MRG

DocuData Solutions, LLC

Canon CF-100

Recordak MRD-2

Non- Responsive

Kodak

Koda

Kodak

Kodak

Kodak

Kodak

Kodak 822-3232

DESCRIPTION

B.   Off-Site Filming Unit Cost

Other Services not listed that should be included

1



$49,750.00 $29,730.000 $32,500.000 $0.000
$117,299.30 $48,160.000 $51,167.400 $16,217.461

Net 20 2% Net 30 2% Net 30 2% Net 30 2%
Discount $2,345.99 $963.20 $1,023.35 $324.35
Grand Total $114,953.31 $47,196.80 $50,144.05 $15,893.11

Terms 

Subtotal 
Total A&B


