
Item Description Est. Qty.
1 Commercial Valve 5

2 Slide Shoe 4

3 Solenoid Valve 2

4  Ejection Cylinder 2

5 Sweep Shaft 2

6 BRZ Bushing 2

7 Packer Sweep Assembly 1

8 Hydraulic Oil 10

Rate Per OT Rate Parts Rate Per OT Rate Parts
Hour Per Hour Discount Parts Labor Hour Per Hour Discount Parts Labor

1 $40.00 $60.00 List-10% 180 days 90 days No Bid $0.00 0% Yes No Bid

2 $40.00 $60.00 List-10% 180 days 90 days $72.00 $72.00 List-0% Yes 72 Hour

3 $40.00 $60.00 List-20% 180 days 90 days $72.00 $72.00 List-20% Yes 72 Hour

4 $40.00 $60.00 List-5% 180 days 90 days No Bid $0.00 0% Yes No Bid

5 $40.00 $60.00 List-12% 180 days 90 days $72.00 $72.00 List-20% Yes 72 hour

6 $40.00 $60.00 List-10% 180 days 90 days $72.00 $72.00 List-0% Yes 72 Hour

7 $40.00 $60.00 List-5% 180 days 90 days No Bid No Bid 0% Yes No Bid

8 $40.00 $60.00 List-5% 180 days 90 days No Bid No Bid 0% Yes No Bid

Note:  Payment term discount:

Section I - Refuse Truck Parts Purchase    
Pak-Mor Parts

$383.15
$64.64

Warranty
* Equipment Southwest Inc.

Unit Price

Item Description

Section II - Repair Service

$91.20

Previous Response Summary
Parts and Repair Service - Refuse Trucks
Bid Number 139-06F

25 Yard Heil F-500, Rear Loader

Brush Trucks/Dump

Dump /Trucks

Hydraulic Brush Loaders - Prentiss

Refuse Packers - Rear Loader - Leach Body

Refuse Packers - Pak-Mor Only

Refuse Packer - Haul-14R -Yard Body Only

$766.30

Refuse Packers - Equipment Not Listed Above

Bid Closing Date:  May 18, 2006
Acting Purchasing Agent:  Darlene Rush, 972.721.3752

Grand Total Parts Sample Listing

$3,563.71
$17.00

$14,470.69

$3,563.71
$1.70

$129.28

* Equipment Southwest Inc.

Net Total
$6,253.60
$140.80

$1,250.72
$35.20

$1,708.80
$182.40

$3,417.60

List Less 20%
List Less 10%

Discount on New Parts

Discount on Rebuilt Parts

Heil Of Texas

Unit Price Net Total
$2,272.82 $11,364.10

$35.99 $143.96

$101.60 $203.20

$2,029.20 $4,058.40

$391.88 $783.76

Heil of Texas

Warranty

$72.53 $145.06

$3,607.43 $3,607.43

* Awardee

Net 302%30

$9.54 $95.40

$20,401.31

List Less 20%

List Less 25%
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