CITY OF IRVING, TEXAS
RESPONSE SUMMARY

REFLECTIVE SIGN MATERIALS

BID NUMBER 163-05F

BID CLOSING DATE: JUNE 23, 2005
PURCHASING AGENT: PAUL FRANKO, 972.721.3753

AWARD AWARD
VENDORS Rocal. Inc. RoadRunner Trafficl Signs Nippon Carbide 3M Company
Group Description Supply, Inc. Industries,Inc.

A Type 1 One Color Faces $3,600.00 $3,330.00 $2,680.00 No Bid No Bid
A Type 1 Two Color Faces $4,080.00 $3,560.00 $2,800.00 No Bid No Bid
A Type 1 Three Color Faces $4,560.00 $3,830.00 $2,550.00 No Bid No Bid
A Type 111 One Color Faces $6,690.00 $6,670.00 $5,310.00 No Bid No Bid
A Type 111 Two Color Faces $7,170.00 $7,090.00 $5,520.00 No Bid No Bid
A [Type Il Three Color Faces $7,650.00 $7,440.00 $5,270.00 No Bid No Bid
SUBTOTAL - ITEM A $33,750.00 $31,920.00 $24,130.00 No Bid No Bid
DISCOUNT % Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
DISCOUNT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL-ITEMA $33,750.00 $31,920.00 $24,130.00 No Bid No Bid

B Roll Goods No Bid No Bid No Bid $26,629.00 $26,245.00

C Misc. Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,000.00 $2,200.00

SUBTOTAL-ITEMB&C No Bid No Bid No Bid $28,629.00 $28,445.00
DISCOUNT % Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
DISCOUNT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TOTAL-ITEMSB &C No Bid No Bid No Bid $28,629.00 $28,445.00

GRAND TOTAL - ITEMSA-C $33,750.00 $31,920.00 $24,130.00 $28,629.00 $28,445.00

Group A Awarded all or none

Group B+C Awarded all or none

Bid Standard MUTCD

Based on All or None
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*Min Order Required
**Bid Alternate Also
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