CITY OF IRVING, TEXAS
RESPONSE SUMMARY
REFLECTIVE SIGN MATERIALS
ITB NUMBER: 180D-09F

ITB CLOSING DATE: JUNE 19, 2009

SENIOR PURCHASING AGENT: DARLENE RUSH, 972.721.3752

©

IRVING

Nippon Carbide Industries

VENDORS Vulcan, Inc. (USA) Inc. Osburn Associates, Inc. Rocal, Inc. Custom Priducts Corp.
Group A Description Unit Price Per Sq. Ft. Unit Price Per Sq. Ft. Unit Price Per Sq. Ft. Unit Price Per Sq. Ft. Unit Price Per Sq. Ft.

Type 1 One-Color Faces

1000 0-1 Square Feet $0.84 $840.00 No Bid $0.90 $900.00 $1.40 $1,400.00 $2.17 $2,170.00

1000 1-4 Square Feet $0.89 $890.00 $0.85 $850.00 $1.20 $1,200.00 $1.26 $1,260.00

1000 |4+ Square Feet $0.89 $890.00 $0.82 $820.00 $1.12 $1,120.00 $1.11 $1,110.00
Type 1 Two-Color Faces

1000 0-1 Square Feet $0.79 $790.00 $0.99 $990.00 $1.69 $1,690.00 $2.52 $2,520.00

1000 1-4 Square Feet $0.95 $950.00 $0.94 $940.00 $1.45 $1,450.00 $1.54 $1,540.00

1000 4+ Square Feet $0.95 $950.00 $0.87 $870.00 $1.35 $1,350.00 $1.26 $1,260.00
Type 1 Three-Color Faces

1000 0-1 Square Feet $0.79 $790.00 $1.03 $1,030.00 $1.98 $1,980.00 $2.94 $2,940.00

1000 1-4 Square Feet $0.79 $790.00 $0.99 $990.00 $1.70 $1,700.00 $1.80 $1,800.00

1000 4+ Square Feet $1.15 $1,150.00 $0.98 $980.00 $1.58 $1,580.00 $1.55 $1,550.00
Type 111 One-Color Faces

1000 0-1 Square Feet $1.44 $1,440.00 $1.68 $1,680.00 $2.05 $2,050.00 $3.02 $3,020.00

1000 1-4 Square Feet $1.58 $1,580.00 $1.67 $1,670.00 $1.76 $1,760.00 $2.21 $2,210.00

1000 4+ Square Feet $1.61 $1,610.00 $1.63 $1,630.00 $1.64 $1,640.00 $2.07 $2,070.00
Type 111 Two-Color Faces

1000 0-1 Square Feet $1.44 $1,440.00 $1.80 $1,800.00 $2.34 $2,340.00 $3.33 $3,330.00

1000 1-4 Square Feet $1.63 $1,630.00 $1.78 $1,780.00 $2.01 $2,010.00 $2.58 $2,580.00

1000 4+ Square Feet $1.61 $1,610.00 $1.76 $1,760.00 $1.87 $1,870.00 $2.21 $2,210.00
Type 111 Three-Color Faces

1000 0-1 Square Feet $1.44 $1,440.00 $2.63 $2,630.00 $2.63 $2,630.00 $3.89 $3,890.00

1000 1-4 Square Feet $1.91 $1,910.00 $2.26 $2,260.00 $2.26 $2,260.00 $3.01 $3,010.00

1000 4+ Square Feet $2.05 $2,050.00 $2.10 $2,100.00 $2.10 $2,100.00 $2.92 $2,920.00
Group A Total $22,750.00 No Bid $25,680.00 $32,130.00 $41,390.00
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CITY OF IRVING, TEXAS
RESPONSE SUMMARY
REFLECTIVE SIGN MATERIALS
ITB NUMBER: 180D-09F

ITB CLOSING DATE: JUNE 19, 2009
SENIOR PURCHASING AGENT: DARLENE RUSH, 972.721.3752

VENDORS Vulcan, Inc. Nippon Carbide Industries Custom Products Corp. Rocal, Inc. Custom Products Corp.
(USA) Inc.
Group B |Roll Goods - Description Unit Price Per Sq. Ft. Unit Price Per Sq. Ft. Unit Price Per Sq. Ft. Unit Price Per Sq. Ft. Unit Price Per Sq. Ft.
15000 Retro -Reflective Sheeting Plotters No Bid $0.70 $10,500.00) $0.67 $10,050.00 $0.84 $12,600.00 $0.71 $10,650.00
500 Retro-Reflective Red/White $0.70 $350.00 $0.99 $495.00 $1.13 $565.00 $0.68 $340.00
10000 Retro-Reflective Sheeting, Class 2 $1.30 $13,000.00) $1.44 $14,400.00 $1.43 $14,300.00 $1.56 $15,600.00
500 Retro-Reflective Red/White Barricade $1.30 $650.00 $1.64 $820.00 $1.84 $920.00 $1.63 $815.00
3000 Non Re“e‘;']‘ézt};':y&g’sznz' Reflective $052|  $1,560.00 $079|  $2,370.00 $0.83|  $2,490.00 $098|  $2,940.00
100 Red - 1172 NP $0.95 $95.00 $1.05 $105.00 $1.28 $128.00 $1.16 $116.00
500 Blue - 1175 NP $0.95 $475.00 $1.05 $525.00 $1.28 $640.00 $1.16 $580.00
500 Green - 1177 NP $0.95 $475.00 $1.05 $525.00 $1.28 $640.00 $1.16 $580.00
100 Black - 1178 $0.95 $95.00 $1.05 $105.00 $1.28 $128.00 $1.16 $116.00
100 Brown - 1179 NP $0.95 $95.00 $1.05 $105.00 $1.28 $128.00 $1.16 $116.00
100 List other colors and corresponding pricing. $0.95 $95.00 $1.05 $105.00 $1.28 $128.00 $1.16 $116.00
Group B Total $27,390.00 $29,605.00 $32,667.00 $31,969.00
C Miscellaneous Materials No Bid
10000 Transfer Tapes $0.25 $2,500.00 $0.34 $3,400.00 $0.14 $1,400.00 $0.40 $4,000.00
5000 Slip Sheeting: No Charge $0.00 $0.03 $150.00 $0.05 $250.00 $0.03 $150.00
Group C Total $2,500.00 $3,550.00 $1,650.00 $4,150.00
A Sign Faces $22,750.00 No Bid $25,680.00 $32,130.00 $41,390.00
B Roll Goods No Bid $27,390.00 $29,605.00 $32,667.00 $31,969.00
C Misc. Materials No Bid $2,500.00 $3,550.00 $1,650.00 $4,150.00
Group A - Gross Total $22,750.00 No Bid $25,680.00 $32,130.00 $41,390.00
Payment Terms Discount Net 30 2% 10 $513.60 Net 30 | $0.00 Net 30 | $0.00
Group A - Net Total $22,750.00 $25,166.40 $32,130.00 $41,390.00
Groups B & C - Gross Total No Bid $29,890.00 $33,155.00 $34,317.00 $36,119.00
Payment Terms Discount Net 30 $0.00] 29 10 $663.10 Net30 |  $0.00 Net30 | $0.00
Group B & C - Net Total No Bid $29,890.00 $32,491.90 $34,317.00 $36,119.00
Groups A, B, and C - Net Total $22,750.00 $29,890.00 $57,658.30 $66,447.00 $77,509.00

This response summary is a listing of those who responded and their pricing. However, the responses have not been evaluated and the bidders have not been determined to be responsive at this time. After a complete
review of the bids, a recommendation for award will be made and posted on-line. Unless stated otherwise in the solicitation documents, award will be made to the lowest, responsive bidder who is deemed able to meet
the requirements and qualifications of the specifications.
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