
Group I -  Couplings Est. 
Qty. Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price

1 Male IP thread 3/4", compression 3/4" 25 $7.05 $176.25 $6.94 $173.50 $6.90 $172.50 $6.69 $167.25 $6.83 $170.75 $6.91 $172.75 No bid $0.00 $6.93 $173.25

2 Male IP thread 1"compression 1" 25 $8.35 $208.75 $8.20 $205.00 $8.15 $203.75 $7.90 $197.50 $7.99 $199.75 $8.18 $204.50 No bid $0.00 $8.22 $205.50

3 Male IP thread 1-1/2",compression 1-1/2" 25 $20.91 $522.75 $20.50 $512.50 $20.45 $511.25 $19.88 $497.00 $20.25 $506.25 $20.45 $511.25 No bid $0.00 $20.57 $514.25

4 Male IP thread 2", compression 2" 25 $30.49 $762.25 $29.93 $748.25 $29.80 $745.00 $28.95 $723.75 $29.00 $725.00 $29.85 $746.25 No bid $0.00 $29.98 $749.50

5 Female IP thread 3/4",compression 3/4" 25 $7.41 $185.25 $7.29 $182.25 $7.26 $181.50 $7.04 $176.00 $7.16 $179.00 $7.26 $181.50 No bid $0.00 $7.29 $182.25

6 Female IP thread 1", compression 1" 25 $10.06 $251.50 $9.91 $247.75 $9.80 $245.00 $9.56 $239.00 $9.59 $239.75 $9.85 $246.25 No bid $0.00 $9.89 $247.25

7 Female IP thread 1-1/2", compression 1-1/2" 25 $26.76 $669.00 $26.25 $656.25 $26.18 $654.50 $25.44 $636.00 $25.20 $630.00 $26.20 $655.00 No bid $0.00 $26.32 $658.00

8 Female IP thread 2",compression 2" 25 $31.87 $796.75 $31.29 $782.25 $31.20 $780.00 $30.28 $757.00 $30.80 $770.00 $31.20 $780.00 No bid $0.00 $31.34 $783.50

9 3/4" copper flare splicer 10 $7.84 $78.40 $7.78 $77.80 $7.75 $77.50 $8.09 $80.90 $7.69 $76.90 $7.00 $70.00 No bid $0.00 $7.79 $77.90

10 1" copper flare splicer 10 $13.73 $137.30 $13.61 $136.10 $13.60 $136.00 $14.17 $141.70 $13.45 $134.50 $10.81 $108.10 No bid $0.00 $13.64 $136.40

11 1-1/2" copper flare splicer 10 $37.68 $376.80 $37.37 $373.70 $37.30 $373.00 $59.85 $598.50 $36.90 $369.00 $26.09 $260.90 No bid $0.00 $37.44 $374.40

12 2" Copper flare splicer 10 $61.48 $614.80 $61.00 $610.00 $60.80 $608.00 $59.85 $598.50 $60.15 $601.50 $46.11 $461.10 No bid $0.00 $61.11 $611.10

13 Meter Key 12 $7.46 $89.52 $7.91 $94.92 $4.50 $54.00 $11.96 $143.52 $6.25 $75.00 $8.50 $102.00 No bid $0.00 $8.00 $96.00

14 Straight Coupling, 3/4" compression both ends 650 $8.59 $5,583.50 $8.43 $5,479.50 $8.40 $5,460.00 $8.16 $5,304.00 $8.21 $5,336.50 $8.40 $5,460.00 No bid $0.00 $8.45 $5,492.50

15 Straight Coupling, 1" compression both ends 100 $9.83 $983.00 $9.52 $952.00 $9.60 $960.00 $9.34 $934.00 $9.50 $950.00 $9.60 $960.00 No bid $0.00 $9.66 $966.00

16 Straight Coupling, 1 1/2" compression both ends 36 $30.06 $1,082.16 $29.49 $1,061.64 $29.40 $1,058.40 $28.57 $1,028.52 $28.50 $1,026.00 $29.40 $1,058.40 No bid $0.00 $29.56 $1,064.16

17 Straight Coupling, 2" compression both ends 48 $40.59 $1,948.32 $39.83 $1,911.84 $39.70 $1,905.60 $38.57 $1,851.36 $40.00 $1,920.00 $39.74 $1,907.52 No bid $0.00 $39.91 $1,915.68

18 Brass Tee 1" x 1" x 1" 12 $22.24 $266.88 $21.75 $261.00 $21.75 $261.00 $22.72 $272.64 $21.55 $258.60 $6.50 $78.00 No bid $0.00 $21.78 $261.36

19 Brass Tee 3/4" x 3/4" x 3/4" 12 $20.79 $249.48 $20.40 $244.80 $20.35 $244.20 $21.25 $255.00 $20.52 $246.24 $4.00 $48.00 No bid $0.00 $20.45 $245.40

20 Brass Tee 3/4" x 3/4" x 1" 12 $22.15 $265.80 $21.44 $257.28 $21.70 $260.40 $22.63 $271.56 $21.50 $258.00 no bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $21.78 $261.36

21 Brass Tee 1" x 1" x 3/4" 12 $22.84 $274.08 $22.33 $267.96 $32.76 $393.12 $22.50 $270.00 $22.00 $264.00 $8.00 $96.00 No bid $0.00 $22.46 $269.52

Items 1-22 Total (Group II Award By Group)       

Group II - Corporations (3/4 " and 1")

22 Corporation Stop with 3/4" IPT inlet, 3/4" compression 
outlet 45 $15.76 $709.20 $15.45 $695.25 $15.40 $693.00 $14.97 $673.65 $14.99 $674.55 $15.55 $699.75 No bid $0.00 $15.49 $697.05

23 Corporation Stop with 1" IPT inlet, 1" compression 
outlet 30 $23.83 $714.90 $23.39 $701.70 $23.30 $699.00 $22.65 $679.50 $22.60 $678.00 $23.50 $705.00 No bid $0.00 $23.44 $703.20

24 Corporation inlet threads 3/4" cc, outlet 3/4" 
compression 250 $15.76 $3,940.00 $15.43 $3,857.50 $15.40 $3,850.00 $14.97 $3,742.50 $14.99 $3,747.50 $15.50 $3,875.00 No bid $0.00 $15.49 $3,872.50

25 Corporation Stop with 1" IPT inlet, 1" compression 
outlet 100 $23.83 $2,383.00 $23.30 $2,330.00 $23.30 $2,330.00 $22.65 $2,265.00 $22.60 $2,260.00 $23.50 $2,350.00 No bid $0.00 $23.44 $2,344.00

Items 22-25 Total (Group II Award By Group)       

Morrison Supply 
Company

$15,285.28

$7,616.75

City of Irving Response Summary 
Brass Fittings, Bid Number 028M-10F 
Bid Closing Date:  October 30, 2009

Vendors HD Supply Waterworks, 
LTD. Ferguson Waterworks

Eagle Underground Utility
Supply, Inc. dba Mainline 

Supply Company

North Star Underground 
Utility Co. LLC

Municipal Water Wroks 
Supply ACT Pipe and Supply Austin Pump & Supply

$15,522.54 $15,236.29 $15,284.72 $15,143.70

$7,629.75 $0.00

$14,936.74 $14,107.52 $0.00

Purchasing Agent:  Marsha Hughes, 972.721.3754

$7,747.10 $7,584.45 $7,572.00 $7,360.65 $7,360.05
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City of Irving Response Summary - Brass Fittings - Bid Number 028M-10F - Bid Closing Date:  October 30, 2009
Purchasing Agent:  Marsha Hughes, 972.721.3754
 

Group III - Corporatons (1-1/2" & 2") Est. 
Qty. Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price

26 Corporation, inlet threads 1-1/2" cc, outlet 1-1/2" 
compression 40 $61.34 $2,453.60 $60.22 $2,408.80 $60.00 $2,400.00 $58.29 $2,331.60 $60.50 $2,420.00 $60.65 $2,426.00 No Bid $0.00 $60.32 $2,412.80

27 Corporation, inlet threads 2" cc, outlet 2" compression 50 $101.45 $5,072.50 $99.59 $4,979.50 $99.30 $4,965.00 $96.43 $4,821.50 $96.13 $4,806.50 $100.30 $5,015.00 No Bid $0.00 $99.76 $4,988.00

28 Corporation, inlet threads 1-1/2" cc, outlet 1-1/2" flare 10 $60.69 $606.90 $60.21 $602.10 $60.00 $600.00 $58.29 $582.90 $57.72 $577.20 $60.00 $600.00 No Bid $0.00 $60.32 $603.20

29 Corporation, inlet threads 2" cc, outlet 2" flare 10 $106.02 $1,060.20 $105.00 $1,050.00 $104.00 $1,040.00 $101.83 $1,018.30 $101.00 $1,010.00 $104.85 $1,048.50 No Bid $0.00 $105.37 $1,053.70

30 Corporation, inlet thread 1-1/2" IPT, outlet 1-1/2" 
compression 10 $61.34 $613.40 $60.21 $602.10 $60.00 $600.00 $58.29 $582.90 $57.78 $577.80 $60.00 $600.00 No Bid $0.00 $60.32 $603.20

31 Corporation, inlet thread 2" IPT, outlet 2" 
compression 10 $101.45 $1,014.50 $99.59 $995.90 $99.30 $993.00 $96.43 $964.30 $96.15 $961.50 $100.25 $1,002.50 No Bid $0.00 $99.76 $997.60

32 Corporation, inlet thread 1-1/2" IPT, outlet 1-1/2" flare 5 $60.69 $303.45 $60.00 $300.00 $60.00 $300.00 $58.29 $291.45 $57.75 $288.75 $60.00 $300.00 No Bid $0.00 $60.32 $301.60

33 Corporation, inlet thread 2" IPT,  outlet thread 2" flare 5 $106.02 $530.10 $104.82 $524.10 $104.00 $520.00 $101.83 $509.15 $101.00 $505.00 $104.85 $524.25 No Bid $0.00 $105.37 $526.85

Items 26-33 Total (Group III Award By Group)       

Group IV -  Meter Valves

34
1" straight ball meter valve, 175 # min. operating 
pressure capacity, inlet compression, outlet meter 

li

9 $47.97 $431.73 $47.07 $423.63 $38.80 $349.20 $45.58 $410.22 $37.02 $333.18 $47.00 $423.00 No Bid $0.00 $38.37 $345.33

35 1-1/2" straight ball meter valve 175# min. Operating 
pressure capacity, inlet compression, outlet meter 12 $77.58 $930.96 $76.96 $923.52 $76.75 $921.00 $74.50 $894.00 $74.00 $888.00 $76.75 $921.00 No Bid $0.00 $77.09 $925.08

36
2" straight ball meter valve, 175# min. Operating 
pressure capacity, inlet compression, outlet meter 
fl d

12 $131.42 $1,577.04 $130.39 $1,564.68 $130.00 $1,560.00 $126.23 $1,514.76 $127.00 $1,524.00 $130.00 $1,560.00 No Bid $0.00 $130.61 $1,567.32

37
3/4" straight ball meter valve.  Compression one end, 
swivel meter coupling other. 10 $32.45 $324.50 $31.73 $317.30 $20.75 $207.50 $30.83 $308.30 $20.75 $207.50 $31.75 $317.50 No Bid $0.00 $20.85 $208.50

Items 34-37 Subtotal (Group IV Award By Group)       

Group V - Angle Meter Valves

38
1-1/2" Angle meter valve with padlock wings and 
support brackets.  Compression X Meter flange. 15 $84.67 $1,270.05 $79.89 $1,198.35 $83.30 $1,249.50 $104.74 $1,571.10 $84.00 $1,260.00 $84.00 $1,260.00 No Bid $0.00 $81.15 $1,217.25

39
2" Angle meter valve with padlock wings and support 
brackets.  Compression X Meter flange. 20 $107.57 $2,151.40 $102.47 $2,049.40 $105.85 $2,117.00 $132.61 $2,652.20 $106.70 $2,134.00 $105.75 $2,115.00 No Bid $0.00 $104.85 $2,097.00

Items 38-39 Subtotal (Group V Award By Group)       

Group VI - Companion Meter Flanges

40 1-12" All brass Companion meter flange 50 $17.50 $875.00 $26.00 $1,300.00 $16.00 $800.00 $36.71 $1,835.50 $17.65 $882.50 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $17.70 $885.00

41 2" All brass Companion meter flange 50 $19.23 $961.50 $33.60 $1,680.00 $16.40 $820.00 $46.17 $2,308.50 $19.25 $962.50 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $20.50 $1,025.00

Items 40-41 Subtotal (Group VI Award By Group) 

Group VII - Angle Ball Meter Valves

42
Angle ball meter valve 5/8" x 3/4" with padlock wings.  
Compression x meter coupling nut. 10 $20.89 $208.90 $23.15 $231.50 $20.45 $204.50 $21.87 $218.70 $19.99 $199.90 $20.25 $202.50 No Bid $0.00 $23.20 $232.00

43
Angle ball meter valve 1" with padlock wings.  
Compression x meter coupling nut. 25 $53.59 $1,339.75 $41.69 $1,042.25 $41.50 $1,037.50 $44.56 $1,114.00 $41.00 $1,025.00 $41.50 $1,037.50 No Bid $0.00 $41.77 $1,044.25

44
Angle ball meter valve 3/4" with padlock wings.  
Female IPT x meter coupling nut.  Ford BA13-232W-
SPT or equivalent

600 $17.79 $10,674.00 $18.95 $11,370.00 $17.40 $10,440.00 $17.69 $10,614.00 $16.97 $10,182.00 $17.40 $10,440.00 No Bid $0.00 $19.27 $11,562.00

45
Angle ball meter valve 1" with padlock wings.  Female 
IPT x meter coupling nut. 15 $48.95 $734.25 $35.00 $525.00 $34.95 $524.25 $33.93 $508.95 $33.78 $506.70 $34.60 $519.00 No Bid $0.00 $35.12 $526.80

46
1-1/2" angle ball meter valve with padlock wings and 
support brackets.  Flare x meter flange. 10 $110.82 $1,108.20 $106.00 $1,060.00 $109.60 $1,096.00 $102.66 $1,026.60 $105.35 $1,053.50 $110.00 $1,100.00 No Bid $0.00 $106.23 $1,062.30

47
2" angle ball meter valve with padlock wings and 
support brackets.  Flare x meter flange. 10 $140.24 $1,402.40 $135.20 $1,352.00 $138.75 $1,387.50 $130.92 $1,309.20 $134.10 $1,341.00 $138.75 $1,387.50 No Bid $0.00 $135.45 $1,354.50

Items 42-47 Total (Group VIl Award By Group)       

$3,421.45 $3,247.75 $3,366.50 $4,223.30 $3,394.00 $3,375.00 $0.00 $3,314.25

$15,781.85

$11,486.95

$3,046.23

$1,910.00

Morrison Supply 
Company

North Star Underground 
Utility Co. LLC

$11,146.75 $11,516.25 $0.00$11,654.65 $11,462.50 $11,418.00 $11,102.10

$14,308.10 $14,686.50 $0.00

$3,264.23 $3,229.13 $3,037.70 $3,127.28

$15,467.50 $15,580.75 $14,689.75 $14,791.45

$4,144.00

$2,952.68 $3,221.50 $0.00

$1,845.00 $0.00 $0.00$1,836.50 $2,980.00 $1,620.00

Vendors HD Supply Waterworks, 
LTD. Ferguson Waterworks

Eagle Underground Utility
Supply, Inc. dba Mainline 

Supply Company

Municipal Water Wroks 
Supply ACT Pipe and Supply Austin Pump & Supply
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City of Irving Response Summary - Brass Fittings - Bid Number 028M-10F - Bid Closing Date:  October 30, 2009
Purchasing Agent:  Marsha Hughes, 972.721.3754
Group VIIl - Meter Loops

48
5/8" x 3/4" meter loop, 7" rise.  Ball valve with padlock 
wings.  Double purpose X Double purpose.  Ford V72-
7W-11-44 or equivalent

300 $52.35 $15,705.00 $50.74 $15,222.00 $47.55 $14,265.00 $51.61 $15,483.00 $50.55 $15,165.00 $51.00 $15,300.00 No Bid $0.00 $50.85 $15,255.00

49
1" meter loop, 10" rise.  Ball valve with padlock wings. 
Double purpose X Double purpose.  50 $102.18 $5,109.00 $100.30 $5,015.00 $100.00 $5,000.00 $100.64 $5,032.00 $98.78 $4,939.00 $101.00 $5,050.00 No Bid $0.00 $100.48 $5,024.00

Items 48-49 Total (Group VIlI Award By Item)       

Group IX - Meter Resetters

50
5/8" x 3/4" x 2" high                                                   
Ford VB42-12WR or equivalent 35 $48.03 $1,681.05 $44.45 $1,555.75 $47.00 $1,645.00 $47.31 $1,655.85 $47.42 $1,659.70 $47.50 $1,662.50 No Bid $0.00 $44.54 $1,558.90

51
5/8" x 3/4" x 15" high                                                   
Ford VB42-15WR or equivalent 25 $49.89 $1,247.25 $40.91 $1,022.75 $48.85 $1,221.25 $49.17 $1,229.25 $49.22 $1,230.50 $49.25 $1,231.25 No Bid $0.00 $40.99 $1,024.75

52
5/8" x 3/4" x 18" high                                                   
Ford VB42-15WR or equivalent 15 $56.33 $844.95 $52.80 $792.00 $55.15 $827.25 $55.50 $832.50 $55.00 $825.00 $55.75 $836.25 No Bid $0.00 $52.91 $793.65

53
1" x 10" high                                                               
Ford VB44- 10WR or equivalent 10 $94.52 $945.20 $81.03 $810.30 $92.55 $925.50 $94.55 $945.50 $92.00 $920.00 $93.50 $935.00 No Bid $0.00 $81.18 $811.80

54
1" x 12" high                                                               
Ford VB44- 12WR or equivalent 10 $96.45 $964.50 $82.95 $829.50 $94.40 $944.00 $95.63 $956.30 $92.00 $920.00 $95.40 $954.00 No Bid $0.00 $83.11 $831.10

55 1" x 15" high                                                               
Ford VB44- 15WR or equivalent 10 $98.74 $987.40 $95.80 $958.00 $96.65 $966.50 $113.66 $1,136.60 $95.00 $950.00 $97.70 $977.00 No Bid $0.00 $95.98 $959.80

56
1-1/2" x 13" high                                                             
Ford VBB46-15 or equivalent 10 $549.54 $5,495.40 $488.17 $4,881.70 $538.00 $5,380.00 $527.15 $5,271.50 $562.00 $5,620.00 $543.00 $5,430.00 No Bid $0.00 $488.94 $4,889.40

57 1" x 15" high                                                               
Ford VB44- 13" length 10 $549.54 $5,495.40 $488.17 $4,881.70 $538.00 $5,380.00 $527.15 $5,271.50 $562.00 $5,620.00 $543.00 $5,430.00 No Bid $0.00 $488.94 $4,889.40

58 1-1/2" X 18" high X 13" length.                                       
Ford VBB46-18 or equivalent.

10 $551.91 $5,519.10 $499.40 $4,994.00 $549.00 $5,490.00 $547.14 $5,471.40 $568.00 $5,680.00 $555.00 $5,550.00 No Bid $0.00 $500.00 $5,000.00

59 2" x 12" high x 17" length.                                           
Ford VBB47-12 or equivalent.

10 n/a $0.00 $614.47 $6,144.70 $589.00 $5,890.00 $588.27 $5,882.70 $637.00 $6,370.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $557.00 $5,570.00

60 2" x 14" high x 17" length                                            
Ford VBB47-14 or equivalent. 10 $601.96 $6,019.60 $556.15 $5,561.50 $589.00 $5,890.00 $588.27 $5,882.70 $637.00 $6,370.00 $595.50 $5,955.00 No Bid $0.00 $557.00 $5,570.00

61 2" x 18" high x 17" length                                            
Ford VBB47-18 or equivalent. 10 $601.96 $6,019.60 $556.15 $5,561.50 $589.00 $5,890.00 $588.27 $5,882.70 $637.00 $6,370.00 $595.50 $5,955.00 No Bid $0.00 $557.00 $5,570.00

Items 50-61 Total (Group IX Award By Item)       

$20,279.00

$37,468.80

$20,104.00 $20,350.00 $0.00

$42,535.20 $34,916.00 $0.00

$20,814.00 $20,237.00 $19,265.00 $20,515.00

$35,219.45 $37,993.40 $40,449.50 $40,418.50
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City of Irving Response Summary - Brass Fittings - Bid Number 028M-10F - Bid Closing Date:  October 30, 2009
Purchasing Agent:  Marsha Hughes, 972.721.3754

Est. 
Qty. Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price

62 3/4" x 6" Brass Nipple 25 $4.69 $117.25 $4.05 $101.25 $3.75 $93.75 no bid $0.00 $5.10 $127.50 No Bid $0.00 $5.12 $128.00 $3.81 $95.25

63 3/4" x Closed Brass Nipple 25 $1.46 $36.50 $1.26 $31.50 $1.18 $29.50 no bid $0.00 $1.60 $40.00 No Bid $0.00 $1.60 $40.00 $1.18 $29.50

64 1" x 6" Brass Nipple 25 $6.84 $171.00 $5.91 $147.75 $5.50 $137.50 no bid $0.00 $7.30 $182.50 No Bid $0.00 $7.48 $187.00 $5.56 $139.00

65 1" x Closed Brass Nipple 25 $2.15 $53.75 $1.87 $46.75 $1.75 $43.75 no bid $0.00 $2.36 $59.00 No Bid $0.00 $2.35 $58.75 $1.76 $44.00

66 1-1/2" x 6" Brass Nipple 25 $12.04 $301.00 $10.41 $260.25 $9.70 $242.50 no bid $0.00 $12.78 $319.50 No Bid $0.00 $13.15 $328.75 $9.78 $244.50

67 1-1/2" x 3" Brass Nipple 25 $6.26 $156.50 $5.41 $135.25 $5.05 $126.25 no bid $0.00 $6.59 $164.75 No Bid $0.00 $6.84 $171.00 $5.08 $127.00

68 2" x 6" Brass Nipple 25 $15.49 $387.25 $13.39 $334.75 $12.50 $312.50 no bid $0.00 $16.36 $409.00 No Bid $0.00 $16.91 $422.75 $12.57 $314.25

69 2" x 3" Brass Nipple 25 $8.01 $200.25 $7.35 $183.75 $6.45 $161.25 no bid $0.00 $8.49 $212.25 No Bid $0.00 $8.76 $219.00 $6.49 $162.25

70 2" x Closed Brass Nipple 6 $6.44 $38.64 $5.93 $35.58 $5.20 $31.20 no bid $0.00 $6.87 $41.22 No Bid $0.00 $7.02 $42.12 $5.24 $31.44

71 3/4" Brass Ells, threaded x threaded. 6 $2.63 $15.78 $2.25 $13.50 $2.15 $12.90 no bid $0.00 $3.05 $18.30 No Bid $0.00 $2.89 $17.34 $1.99 $11.94

72 3/4" Brass Ells, comp x comp. 25 $11.11 $277.75 $10.96 $274.00 $10.85 $271.25 no bid $0.00 $12.00 $300.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $10.98 $274.50

73 1" Brass Ells, threaded x threaded. 6 $4.05 $24.30 $3.46 $20.76 $3.30 $19.80 no bid $0.00 $4.65 $27.90 No Bid $0.00 $4.43 $26.58 $3.06 $18.36

74 1" Brass Ells, comp x comp. 25 $14.27 $356.75 $14.12 $353.00 $13.95 $348.75 no bid $0.00 $15.42 $385.50 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $14.14 $353.50

75 1-1/2" Brass Ells, threaded x threaded. 6 $8.05 $48.30 $6.88 $41.28 $6.60 $39.60 no bid $0.00 $9.25 $55.50 No Bid $0.00 $8.82 $52.92 $6.09 $36.54

76 1' 1/2" Brass Ells, comp x comp 6 $41.86 $251.16 $42.25 $253.50 $40.95 $245.70 no bid $0.00 $45.23 $271.38 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $41.55 $249.30

77 2" Brass Ells, threaded x threaded. 6 $13.11 $78.66 $11.20 $67.20 $10.75 $64.50 no bid $0.00 $15.07 $90.42 No Bid $0.00 $14.33 $85.98 $9.90 $59.40

78 2" Brass Ells, comp x comp. 25 $84.70 $2,117.50 $83.91 $2,097.75 $82.90 $2,072.50 no bid $0.00 $87.00 $2,175.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $84.06 $2,101.50

Items 62-78 Total (Group X Award By Group)       

City of Irving Response Summary - Brass Fittings - Bid Number 028M-20F - Bid Closing Date:  October 30, 2009
Purchasing Agent:  Marsha Hughes, 972.721.3754

Group XI - Brass Bushings
79 1" x 3/4" brass bushing CC x CC 160 $6.20 $992.00 $6.42 $1,027.20 $6.00 $960.00 no bid $0.00 $6.34 $1,014.40 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $6.43 $1,028.80

80 1" x 3/4" brass bushing IPT x IPT 15 $2.13 $31.95 $1.61 $24.15 $1.85 $27.75 no bid $0.00 $2.34 $35.10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $1.70 $25.50

81 1-1/2" x 1" brass bushing CC x CC 10 $15.34 $153.40 $15.83 $158.30 $15.00 $150.00 no bid $0.00 $15.55 $155.50 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $15.88 $158.80

82 1-1/2" x 1" brass bushing IPT x IPT 25 $4.64 $116.00 $3.50 $87.50 $4.00 $100.00 no bid $0.00 $7.97 $199.25 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $3.70 $92.50

83 2" x 1-1/2" brass bushing CC x CC 10 $18.67 $186.70 $19.29 $192.90 $18.25 $182.50 no bid $0.00 $19.08 $190.80 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $19.34 $193.40

84 2" x 1-1/2" brass bushing IPT x IPT 10 $6.86 $68.60 $5.18 $51.80 $5.95 $59.50 no bid $0.00 $7.86 $78.60 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $5.49 $54.90

85 2" x 3/4" brass bushing IPT x IPT 10 $8.28 $82.80 $6.25 $62.50 $7.15 $71.50 no bid $0.00 $9.45 $94.50 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $6.61 $66.10

86 2" x 1" brass bushing IPT x IPT 10 $8.28 $82.80 $6.25 $62.50 $7.15 $71.50 no bid $0.00 $8.72 $87.20 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $6.61 $66.10

87 2-1/2" x 1" brass bushing IPT x IPT 6 $17.03 $102.18 $12.90 $77.40 $14.75 $88.50 no bid $0.00 $11.15 $66.90 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $13.64 $81.84

88 2-1/2" x 2" brass bushing IPT x IPT 6 $13.73 $82.38 $10.39 $62.34 $11.85 $71.10 no bid $0.00 $13.35 $80.10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $10.98 $65.88

89 3" x 2" brass bushing IPT x IPT 10 $20.76 $207.60 $15.69 $156.90 $17.95 $179.50 no bid $0.00 $13.75 $137.50 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $16.58 $165.80

Items79-89 Total (Group XI - Award By Group)       

Group XII - Brass Gate Valves

90 1-1/2" gate valve, brass, wheel operated 4 $17.63 $70.52 $20.34 $81.36 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 $24.25 $97.00 $17.00 $68.00 No Bid $0.00 $21.50 $86.00

91 2" gate valve, brass, wheel operated 4 $26.00 $104.00 $29.88 $119.52 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 $34.57 $138.28 $25.00 $100.00 No Bid $0.00 $31.60 $126.40

Items 90-91 Total (Group XIl Award By Item)       

$4,292.23

$1,999.62

$212.40

Morrison Supply 
Company

$4,879.72$4,632.34 $4,397.82 $4,253.20 $0.00 $0.00 $1,780.19

$0.00 $0.00$2,139.85

$174.52 $200.88 $0.00 $0.00 $235.28

$2,106.41 $1,963.49 $1,961.85 $0.00

Vendors HD Supply Waterworks, 
LTD. Ferguson Waterworks

Eagle Underground Utility
Supply, Inc. dba Mainline 

Supply Company

North Star Underground 
Utility Co. LLC

Municipal Water Wroks 
Supply ACT Pipe and Supply Austin Pump & Supply

Group X - Brass Nipples & Brass Ells

$168.00 $0.00
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City of Irving Response Summary - Brass Fittings - Bid Number 028M-20F - Bid Closing Date:  October 30, 2009
Purchasing Agent:  Marsha Hughes, 972.721.3754

Group XIII - Brass Ground Nuts

92 Ford 3/4" Brass Ground Nut or equivalent 12 $4.99 $59.88 $0.00 $0.00 $4.70 $56.40 no bid $0.00 $3.99 $47.88 $3.00 $36.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

93 Mueller 3/4" Brass Ground Nut or equivalent 12 $4.99 $59.88 $8.03 $96.36 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 $3.99 $47.88 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

94 Ford 1" Brass Ground Nut or equivalent 12 $7.99 $95.88 $0.00 $0.00 $7.60 $91.20 no bid $0.00 $5.45 $65.40 $4.00 $48.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

95 Mueller 1" Brass Ground Nut or equivalent 12 $7.99 $95.88 $11.50 $138.00 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 $5.45 $65.40 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

Items 92-95 Total (Group XIlI Award By Item)       

Gross Total - Groups I - XIlI (Items 1-95) $122,172.21 $124,347.82 $123,065.82 $120,825.98 $126,063.93  $110,054.52 $1,780.19  $122,693.36

Discound Payment Terms Net 30 $0.00 Net 30/10th 
Prox $0.00 2% 10  $2,461.32 2% 15  $2,416.52 Net 30 $0.00 2% 30  $2,201.09 2% 30 $35.60 Net 10 $0.00

Net Total - Groups I - XIII (Items 1-95) $122,693.36
AY McDonald

$0.00$0.00

Brand Bid Ford/Watts

$226.56 $84.00

$126,063.93 $107,853.43

$311.52

$1,744.59$122,172.21 $124,347.82 $120,604.50 $118,409.46

$234.36 $0.00$147.60

Mueller/Midland/Merit/Wa
tts

Ford/Matco/Norca/Generi
c

McDonald/James 
Jones/Mueller Ford/Midland/Matco/Norca Cambridge Ford/IMC/Import/Merritt
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