City of Irving, Texas
Response Summary

Fire Department Bunker Clothing

ITB Number: 248M-09F
Closing Date: September 28, 2009
Purchasing Agent: Marsha Hughes, 972-721-3754

IRVING

Vendors

ITEMS 1 & 2 (ALL OR NONE)

Fisher Scientific Co LLC

Casco Industries Inc.

North America Fire Equipment
Company, Inc./NAFECO

ltem | Qty. | Unit Description Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price
1| 25 | EA F'rec':(')%?“”g $978.10 | $24,452.50 | No Bid $0.00 $961.50 | $24,037.50
2 | 65 | EA Firefighter $648.29 | $42,138.85 | No Bid $0.00 $585.80 | $38,077.00
Trousers
Subtotal (Items 1 and 2) $66,591.35 $0.00 $62,114.50
Discount Net 30 $0.00 Net 30 $0.00 Net 30 $0.00
Total (Items 1 and 2) $66,591.35 $0.00 $62,144.50
Items 3 -7
Firefighter .
3 | 40 | EA $18.69 $747.60 No Bid $0.00 $18.99 $759.60
Suspenders
H-Back
3| 20 | EA Firefighter $25.13 $502.60 No Bid $0.00 $24.78 $495.60
Suspenders
4 | 60 | PR 14;;‘;':;0” No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $273.41 | $16,404.60
5 5 EA Firefighter No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $209.00 | $1,045.00
Helmets
6 | 250 | PR F'éflgsgtser $47.89 | $11,972.50 | $52.50 | $13,125.00 | $51.35 | $12,837.50
7 | 100 | EA Pﬁéﬁg’e No Bid No Bid $53.00 $5,300.00 $58.31 $5,831.00
Discount Net 30 $0.00 Net 30 $0.00 Net 30 $0.00




