WHITRn

DocType:

[Ordinance Number} 2015-9753

T

[Meeting Date] 12-10-15

Code Chapter

U0 IIIIIIIIIII|IllI|IIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIII|I||II|I|I|||II|II|II|I

Code Subject] IRVING LAND OPMENT CODE

L0 IIII|II|II|I|||II|||II|I|II|IIII|||IIII||I|I|I|I|||III|IIIII|III|IIIIIII||I||||I|I|I|III||||I|||I|II||II|I|I

Cross Reference]

o

12/14/2015 12:22 Username: dmontoya



;. ORDINANCE NO. ORD-2015-9753~

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION 17-4 OF CHAPTER 17 OF THE LAND
DEVELOPMENT "~ CODE OF THE CITY OF IRVING, TEXAS, BY ADOPTING THE
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, 2015 EDITION WITH AMENDMENTS; DESIGNATING IT AS
THE FIRE CODE OF THE CITY OF IRVING; REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 2012-9408 OF THE
LAND DEVELOPMENT. CODE OF THE CITY OF IRVING, TEXAS; PROVIDING A
SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF IRVING, TEXAS:

SECTION 1. That Section 17-4 of Chapter 17 of the Land Development Code of the City of
Irving, Texas, is hereby amended to read as follows '

Sec. 17—4. International Fire Code.

" (a) Adopted. The City of Irving hereby adopts the provisions contained in the 2015 International .
Fire Code as published by the International Code Council, Inc., a copy of which is on file in the Office
of the City Secretary of the City of Irving, with amendments, modifications, and deletions as set forth
in section (b) of this article. In Chapter 17 of The Land Development Code of the City of Irving, Texas,
the words “this code” shall mean the International Fire Code as adopted by the City of Irving.

(b) Amendments, modifications and deletions.

Section. 101.1. Section 101.1 of Section 101 “Scope and General Requirements” of Chapter 1
“Scope and Administration” of this code is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of Irving, Texas.

Section 101.2.1. Section 101.2.1 of Section 101 “Scope and General churrements” of Chapter 1
“Scope and Admmlstrauon of this code is amended to read as follows: '

101.2.1 ‘Appendices. Appendix B - “Fire-Flow Requlrements for Buildings,” as amended, Appendix
C - “Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution,” as amended, and Appendix D - “Fire Apparatus Access

Roads,” as amended, shall be considered part of the requirements of this code.

Section 102.1. Section 102.1 of Section 102 “Applicability” of" Chapter 1 “Scope and
Administration” of this code is amended to read as follows

102.1 Construction and design provisions. The construction and de51gn prov151ons of this code
shall apply to:

1. Structures, facilities and _conditions arising after the adoption of this code.

2. Existing structures, facilities and conditions not legally in ex1stence at the time of adop’uon of
this code. : :

3. Existing structures facilities and conditions when required in Chapter 11 or in specific sections
of this code



4. Existing structures facilities and conditions which, in the opinion of the code ofﬁmal constitute
a distinct hazard to life or property.

5. The pro.visions of this code apply to buildings built under the IRC and IBC.

Section-102.4. Section 102.4 of Section 102 “Applicability” of Chapter 1 “Scope and Admmlstratlon
of this code is amended to read as follows: :

102.4 Application of building code. The design and construction of new structures shall comply
with this code, and other codes as applicable and any alterations, additions, changes in use or changes
in structures required by this code, which are within the scope of the International Building Code,
shall be made in accordance therewith.

Section 102.7. Section 102.7 of Section 102 “Applicability” of Chapter 1 “Scope and Administration”
of this code is amended to read as follows:

102.7 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards referenced in. this code shall be
those that are listed in Chapter 80 and such codes, when specifically adopted, and standards shall be
considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference. .
Where differences occur between the provisions of this code and the referenced standards, the
provisions of this code shall apply. Whenever amendments have been adopted to the referenced
codes and standards, each reference to said code and standard shall be considered to reference the

~ amendments as well. Any reference to NFPA 70 or the ICC Electrical Code shall mean the Electrical
Code as adopted. Codes and standards shall be the most recent edition available.

Section 103. Section 103 “Department of Fire Prevention” of Chapter 1 “Scope and Administration”
is'amended by deleting section 103.2 “Appointment.”

Sectzon 104.9. Section 104.9 of Section 104 “General Authority and Respon51b111t1es” of Chapter 1
“Scope and Administration” of this code is amended to read as follows

104.9 Alternative materials and methods. The prov'isions of this code are not intended to prevent
the installation of any material or to prohibit any method of construction not specifically prescribed
by this code, provided that any such alternative has been approved. The fire code official is authorized
to approve alternative material or method of construction where the fire code official finds that the
proposed design is satisfactory and complies with the intent of the provisions of this code, and that
the material, method or work offered is, for the purpose intended, at least the equivalent of that
prescribed in thls code in quality, strength, effectiveness, fire re51stance durability and safety.

Section 105.6.45. Section 105.6.45 of Section. 105 “Permits” of Chapter 1 “Scope and
‘ Admlmstratlon of this code is amended to read as follows:

105.6.45 Temporary membrane structures and tents. An operational permit is required to operate
an air-supported temporary membrane structure or a tent having an area in excess of 400 square feet,
or a tent, open Wrthout sidewalls or drops on 75 percent or more of the perimeter, in excess of 1600
square feet.



.

Exceptions: - ‘
1. Tents used exélﬁsively for recreational camping purposes.'
2. Fabric tents open on all sides Which comply wifh all of the following:
2.1. Individual tents having a maximum size of 1,600 square feet.

2.2. The aggregate area of multiple tents placed side by side without a fire break
clearance of not less than 20 feet shall not exceed 1,600 square feet total.

2.3. A minimum clearance of 20 feet to structures.

Section 105.7.9. Section 105.7.9 of Section 105 “Permits” of Chaptef 1 “Scope and Administration”
of this code is amended to read as follows: :

105.7.9 Electronic access control systems. Construction permits are required for the installation or
medification of an electronic access control system, as specified in Section 503 and Section1010. A
separate construction permit is required for the installation or modification of a fire alarm system that
may be connected to the access control system. Maintenance performed in accordance with this code
is not considered a modification and does not require a permit. '

Section 105.7.14.  Section 105.7.14 of Section 105 “Permits” of Chapter 1 “Scope and
Administration” of this code is amended to read as follows:

105.7.14 Smoke control or exhaust systems. Construction permits are required for smoke control
or exhaust systems as specified in Section 909 and Section 910, respectively. Maintenance performed

in accordance with this code is not considered a modification and does not require a permit.

Section 105.7.18.  Section 105.7.18 of Section 105 “Permits” of Chapter 1 “Scope and
Administration” “Qf this code is amended to read as follows: .

105.7.18 Temporary membrane structures and tents. A construction permit is required to erect an
air-supported temporary membrane structure or a tent having an area in excess of 400 square feet, or
a tent, open without sidewalls or drops on 75 percent or more of the perimeter, in excess of 1,600
square feet. ' '
Exceptions:
1. Tents used exclusively for recreational camping purposes.

2. Funeral tents and curtains or extensions attached thereto, when used for funeral services.

3. "Fabric tents open on all sides which comply with all of the following:



3.1. Individual tents having a maximum size of 1,600 square feet.

3.2. The aggregate area of rﬁultiple tents placed side by side without a fire break
clearance of not less than 20 feet shall not exceed 1,600 square feet total.

3.3." A minimum clearance of 20 feet to structures

Section 106. Sectlon 106 “Inspections” of Chapter 1 “Scope and Admmlstrat]on of this code is
amended by adding Sections 106.5 and 106.6 to read as follows:

106.5 Approval by the fire code official. Each application for a certificate of occupancy (as required
by the International Building Code) must be reviewed and the premises approved by the fire code
official before a certificate of occupancy may be issued. If a facility is closed for failure to comply .
with a provision of any applicable law, the code official or the building official shall revoke its
certificate of occupancy. He or she shall not issue a new certificate of occupancy for the facility
unless and until it is in compliance with all current applicable codes and laws. The building official
or the fire code official may waive the requirement for compliance with one or more provisions of
the current laws if the building is brought into compliance with the most strmgent comparable code
provision or provisions practicable under the circumstances.

106.6 Letter of compliance issued for shell buildings. When requested by the building owner, the
building official may issue a letter of compliance for shell buildings when he or she determines on final
inspections that the building or structure complies with the [nternational Building Code, the provisions
of this code, the site plan, if applicable, and other applicable laws.

~ Section 108.3. Section 108.3 of Section 108 “Board of Appeals” of Chapter 1 “Scope and
Administration” of this code is amended to read as follows:

108.3 Qualifications. The provisions of this section shall apply to Chapter 8B in the Irving Land
Development Code. There has been established the Construction Board of Appeals consisting of seven
(7) members as follows: one (1) interested citizen, one (1) master electrician or electrical contractor, one
(1) master plumber or plumbing contractor, one (1) class "A" licensed mechanical (HVAC) contractor
or mechanical engineer, one (1) home builder, one (1) representative from the fire protection industry
and one (1) licensed architect or engineer. The board members shall be residents of the city and shall be
appointed by the city council. The building official and the fire chief are ex officio members of the board.

Section 109.4. Section 109.4 of Section 109 “Violations” of Chapter 1 “Scope and Administration”
of this code is amended to read as follows: -

109.4 Violation penalties. The penalty for a violation of this code shall be between $1.00 and
$500.00, unless the complaint alleges that the offense was committed intentionally, knowingly or
recklessly, in which case, the penalty shall be from $1.00 to $2,000.00. Each day that a violation
continués after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.



Section 111. 4 of Section 111 “Stop Work Order” of Chapter 1 “Scope and Admmlstratlon” of this code
is amended to read as follows: ‘

111.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a
stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than $200 or more than $2,000. Each day that a violation
continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

Section 202. Section 202 “General Definitions” of Chapter 2 “Definitions” of this code is amended by
adding the definitions of “Addressable Fire Detection System,” “Analog Intelligent Addressable Fire:
Detection System,” “Building Code,” “Care Facility,” “Fire Code,” “Fire Department,” “IBC,” “Motor
Fuel Container,” “Motor Vehicle,” “NFPA,” “Pyrotechnic Operator,” “Repair Garage,” “Residential
Area,” “Self-service Storage Facility,” “Standby Personnel,” “Standpipe, Types of: Manual dry,” and
“Trench Burner” and amending the definitions of “Ambulatory Care Facility,” “Atrium,” “Building
Official,” “Fire Chief,” “Fire Watch,” “High-Piled Combustible Storage,” “Jurisdiction,” and “Business
Group B,” “High-hazard Group H,” and “Residential Group R-3” under “Occupancy Classification” to
read as follows:

ADDRESSABLE FIRE DETECTION SYSTEM. Any system capable of providing identification of
each individual alarm-initiating device. The identification shall be in plain English and as descriptive as
possible to specifically identify the location of the devnce in alarm. The system shall have the capability
of alarm verification.

[B] AMBULATORY CARE FACILITY. Buildings or portions thereof used to provide medical,
surgical, psychiatric, nursing, or similar care on a less than 24-hour basis to individuals who are rendered
incapable of self-preservation. This group may include, but not be limited to, the following:

1. Dialysis centers.
2. Sedation dentistry
3. Surgery centers
4. Colonic centers

- 5. Psychiatric centers

ANALOG INTELLIGENT ADDRESSABLE FIRE DETECTION SYSTEM. Any system capable
of calculating a change in value by directly measurable quantities (voltage, resistance, etc.) at the sensing
point. The physical analog may be conducted at the sensing point or at the main control panel. The system
shall'be capable of compensating for long-term changes in sensor response while maintaining a constant
sensitivity. The compensation shall have a preset point at which a detector maintenance signal shall be
transmitted to the control panel. The sensor shall remain capable of detectmg and transmitting an alarm
while in maintenance alert.

[B] ATRIUM. An opening connecting three or more stories other than enclosed stairways, elevators,
hoistways, escalators, plumbing, electrical, air-conditioning or other equipment, which is closed at the
top and not defined as a mall. Stories, as used in this definition, do not include balconies within assembly
- groups or mezzanines that comply with Section 505 of the International Building Code. :

-5-



BUILDING CODE. The Intemational Building Code as adopted and amended by the city council.

[B] BUILDING OFFICIAL. The city manager de51gnee to this posmon or hlS or her designated
representative.

CARE FACILITY. ‘Any adult or child day care famhty, nursery, nursing home, group home hospltal or
medical treatment facility or clinic, or other similar structures or uses.

FIRE CHIEF. The chief of the City of Irving Fire Department or a duly authorized representative.
FIRE CODE. The International Fire Code as adopted and amended by the city council.
FIRE DEPARTMENT. The City of Irving Fire Department.

FIRE WATCH. A temporary measure intended to ensure continuous and systematic surveillance of a
building or portion thereof by one or more qualified individuals or standby personnel when required by
the fire code official, for the purposes of identifying and controlling fire hazards, detecting early signs of
unwanted fire, raising an alarm of fire and notifying the fire department.

HIGH-PILED COMBUSTIBLE STORAGE. Storage of combustible materials in closely packed piles
or combustible materials on pallets, in racks or on shelves where the top of storage is greater than 12 feet
in height. When required by the fire code official, high-piled combustible storage also includes certain
high-hazard commodities, such as rubber tires, Group A plastics, flammable liquids, idle pallets and
similar commodities, where the top of storage is greater than 6 feet in height. Any building exceeding

6,000 square feet that has a clear height in excess of 12 feet, making it possible to be used for storage in
excess of 12 feet, shall be considered to be high-piled storage and shall comply with the provisions of
this section. When a specific product cannot be identified, a fire protection system and life safety features
shall be installed as for Class IV commodities, to the maximum pile height.

IBC. The Internationql Building Code adopted in Chapter 8B of the Irving Land Development Code.

[BG] Business G‘roup B. Business Group B occupancy includes, among others, the use of a building
or structure, or a portion thereof, for office, professional or service-type transactions, including
storage or records and accounts. Business occupancies shall include, but not be limited to, the
following; ‘ ‘

Airport traffic control towers .
Ambulatory care facilities” . o o
Animal hospitals, kennels, and pounds
Banks
Barber and beauty shops
Car wash
Civic administration
Clinic-outpatient :
Dry cleaning and laundries; pick-up and dehvery stations and self-service
" Educational occupancies for students above the 12th grade
Electronic data processing I
Fire stations ' »
 Food processing establishments and commercnal kltchens not assomated Wlth restaurants,
cafeterias and similar dining facilities not more than 2,500 square feet in area

-6-



Laboratories: testing and research
Motor vehicle showrooms
- Police stations with detent1on fac111t1es for 5 or less
Post offices
Print shops »
Professional services (architects, attomeys dentists, physmans engmeers etc. )
Radio and television stations . : ~
Telephone exchanges’ :
Training and skill development not within a school or academic program.

High-hazard Group H. High-hazard Group"H occupancy includes, among others, the use of a
" building or structure, or a portion thereof, that involves the manufacturing, processing generation or
storage of material that constitute a physical or.health hazard in quantities in excess of those allowed
in control areas complying with Section 5003.8.3, based on maximum allowable quantity limits for
control areas-set forth in Tables 5003.1.1(1) and- 5003.1.1(2). Hazardous occupancies are classified
in Groups H-1, H-2, H-3, H-4 and H-5 and shall be in accordance with this code and the requirements
of Section 415 of the International Building Code. Hazardous materials stored or used on top of roofs
or canoples shall be classified as outdoor storage or use and shall comply with thlS code.

Exceptlons The following shall not be class1ﬁed as Group H, but shall be classified as the
occupancy that they most nearly resemble. -

1.

Buildings and structures occupied for the application of flammable finishes, provided that
such buildings or areas conform to the requirements of Chapter 24 of this code and Section
416 of the International Building Code

Wholesale and retail sales and storage of flammable and combust;ble liquids in mercantile
occupanc1es conforming to Chapter 57

Closed piping system contammg ﬂammable or combustible lzquzds or gases utilized for
the operation of machinery or equ1pment

Cleanlng establishments that utlllze combustible liquid solvents have a flash point of
140°F (60°C) or higher in. closed systems employing equipment listed by an approved
testing agency, provided that this occupancy is separated from all other areas of the
building by 1-hour fire barriers in accordance with Section 707 of the International
Building Code or 1-hour horizontal assemblies in accordarice with Section 711 of the
International Building Code, or both. (See also Chapter 21, Dry Cleaning, prov151ons of
this code.)

Cleaning establishments that utilize a liquid solvent having a flash point at or above 200°F.
Liquor stores and distributors without bulk storage.
’ ¥

Refrigeration systems.

The storage or utilization of materials for agricultural purposes on the premises.



9. Stationary batteries utilized for facility emergency power, uninterrupted power supply or
" telecommunication facilities, provided that the batteries are provided with safety venting
caps and ventilation is provided in accordance with the International Mechanical Code.

10. Corrosives shall not include personal or household producfs in their original packaging
used in retail display or commonly used building materials.

11. Buildings and structures occupied for éeresol storage shall be classified as Group S-1,
provided that such buildings conform to the requirements of Chapter 51 of the
Internatlonal Fire Coa’e :

12. Display and storage of nonflammable solid and nonflammable or noncombustible liquid
hazardous materials in quantities not exceeding the. maximum allowable quantity per
control area in Groups M or S occupancies complying with Section 414.2.5 of the
International Building Code.

13. The storage of black powder, smokeless propellant, and small arms primers in Groups M
and R-3 and special industrial explosive devices in Groups B, F, M, and S, provided such
storage conforms to the quantity limits and requirements prescribed in the International
Fire Code.

Residential Group R-3. Residential occupancies where the occupénts are primarily permanent in -
nature and not classified as Group R-1, R-2, R-4, or |, including:

Boarding houses (nontransient) with 16 or fewer occupants
Boarding houses (transient) with 10 or fewer o¢cupants
Buildings that do not contain more than 2 dwelling units.

Adult care facﬂltles that provide accommodations for 5 or fewer persons of any age for less than
24 hours. | '

Child care facilities that provide accommodatlons for 5 or fewer persons of any age for less than
24 hours.

Congregate living facilities with 16 or fewer persons.
Lodging Houses with five or fewer guest rooms.

Adult care and child care facilities with5 or fewer unrelated persons that are within a single-
family home are permitted to comply with the International Residential Code.

. MOTOR FUEL CONTAINER. An LP-gas contamer mounted on a vehicle to store LP-gas as the fuel
supply to an engme used to propel the vehicle. A

‘MOTOR VEHICLE. A vehicle, machine tractor, trailer, or semitrailer propelled or drawn by
mechanical power and used on a highway. The phrase does not mclude a vehicle, machine, tractor, trailer,
or semitrailer operated exclusively on a rail.



NFPA. The National Fire Protection Association Codes and Standards.

PYROTECHNIC OPERATOR. An individual possessing a current State of Texas pyrotechnic license
and approved by the fire code official to be responsible for pyrotechmcs pyrotechmc special effects
materials, or both.

REPAIR GARAGE. A building, structure or portion thereof used for servicing or repairing motor
vehicles. This occupancy shall also include garages involved in minor repair, modification and servicing
of motor vehicles for items such as lube changes, inspections, windshield repair or replacement, shocks,
~ minor part replacement and other such minor repairs. '

RESIDENTIAL AREA. A lot or tract of land zoned R-40, R-15, R-10, R-7.5, R-6, R-6A, R-3.5, R-2.5,
R-MF, R-MF-1, R-MF-2, R-TH, R-MH, R-XF, R-PH, R-ZL, R-ZLa, R-SFA, PUD, M-FW, or S-P-1 or
S-P-2 for residential purposes under the City of Irving Comprehensive Zoning Ordinance and any other
lot or tract of land, regardless of its zoning, spe01al or overlay district, upon which there is located at least
one dwellmg unit.

SELF-SERVICE STORAGE FACILITY. Real property designed and used for the purpose of renting
or leasing individual storage spaces to customers for the purpose of stormg and removmg personal
property on a self-service basis. ~ .

STANDBY PERSONNEL. Qualified fire service personnel, approved by the fire chief. When utilized,
the number required shall be as directed by the fire chlef Charges for utilization shall be as normally
-calculated by the jurisdiction.

STANDPIPE, TYPES OF.

Manual dry. A dry standpipe system that does not have a permanent water supply attached to the
system. Manual dry standpipe systems require water from a fire department pumper to be pumped
into the system through the fire department connection in order to meet the system demand. The
system must be supervised as spemﬁed in Section 905 2. :

TRENCH BURNER. A portable device used to mtroduce air mto a pit being used for burning debris,
also called an air curtain destructor ,

Section 302. Section 302 “Definitions” of Chapter 3 “General Requirements” of this code is amended
by addmg the definitions of “Approved Slgnage” and “Grlll” to read as follows:

- APPROVED SIGNAGE. A sign, placard, or decal no less than 24 square inches in size with bold
lettering, contrasting in color to its background no less than % inch high stating, "PROHIBITED THE
USE OF ANY GRILL, HIBACHI, OR SMOKER WITHIN 10 FEET OF BUILDING OR OVERHANG
IRVING FIRE CODE $2,000 FINE" and with graphics as indicated in the illustrations below:



-PROHIBITED-
THE USE OF ANY GRILL HIBACHI, OR SMOKER IN OR
WITHIN 10 FEET OF BUILDING OR OVERHANG
IRVING FIRE CODE $2,000 FINE

5” X 5"

_ -PROHIBITED-. -
THE USE OF ANY GRILL, HIBACHI, OR .
SMOKER IN OR WITHIN 10 FEET OF
BUILDING OR OVERHANG
IRVING FIRE CODE $2,000 FINE -

3" X 8"
. ‘\ N
“GRILL. A cooking utensil on which food is exposed directly to red heat or open flame as from heated
briquettes, charcoal, electricity, natural gas, propane compressed gas or wood, which is commonly
-referred to as a barbecue grill, hibachi, or smoker. :

Section 307.2. Section 307.2 of Section 307 “Open Burning, Recreational Fires and Portable Outdoor
Fireplaces” of Chapter 3 “General Requirements” of this code is amended to read.as follows:

307.2 Permit required. A permit shall be obtained from the fire code official in accordance with
Section 105.6 prior to kindling a fire for recognized silvicultural or range or wildlife-management
practices, prevention or control of disease or pests, bonfire, or open burning. Application for such
approval shall only be presented by and permits issued to the owner of the land upon which the fire

is to be kmdled
~

~ -10-



Section 307.4. Section 307.4 of Section 307 “Open Burning, Recreational Fires and Portable Outdoor
Fireplaces™ of Chapter 3 “General Requirements” of this code is amended to read as follows: '

307.4 Location. The location for open burning shall not be less than 300 feet from any structure, and
provisions shall be made to prevent the fire from spreading to within 300 feet of any structure.
Provisions shall be made to prevent the fire from spreading from the approved location.

Section 307. Section 307 “Open Burning, Recreational Fires, and Portable Outdoor Fireplaces” of
Chapter 3 “General Requirements” of this code is amended by adding Sections 307.4.4 and 307.4.5 to
read as follows:

307.4.4 Permanent outdoor firepit. Permanently .installed outdoor firepits for recreational fire
purposes shall not be installed within 10 feet of a structure or combustible material.

Exception: Permanently installed -outdoor fireplaces constructed in accordance with the
International Building Code.

307.4.5 Trench burns. Trench burns shall be conducted' in air curtain trenches and in accordance
with Sections 307.2 and 307.3. '

Section 307.5. Section 307.5 of Section 307 “Open Burning, Recreational Fires and Portable Outdoor
Fireplaces” of Chapter 3 “General Requirements” of this code is amended to read as follows:

307.5 Attendance. Open burning, trench burns, bonfires, recreational fires, or use of portable outdoor
fireplaces shall be constantly attended until the fire is extinguished. A minimum of one portable fire -
extinguisher complying with Section 906 with a minimum 4-A rating and other approved on-site fire-
extinguishing equipment, such as dirt, sand, water barrel garden hose or water truck, shall be
available for immediate utilization.

Section 308.1.4. Section 308.1.4 of Section 308 “Open Flames” of Chapter 3 “General Requirements”
of this code is amended to read as follows:

308.1.4 Open-flame cooking devices. It is unlawful for any person to construct, erect, install,
maintain or use any incinerator, barbecue pit, fixed or portable grill, or other open flame cooking
device or burn any combustible material as to constitute or occasion a fire hazard by its use or burning
or as to endanger the life or property of any person.

' Seetion 308. Section 308 “Open Flames” of Chapter 3 “General Requirements” of this code is
amended by adding Sections 308.1.4.1, 308.1.4.2, 308.1.4.3, 308.1.4.4, and 308.1.4.5 to read as follows:

308.1.4.1. It is unlawful for any person to use or allow or permit to be used a fixed or portable
grill in a R-1, R-2 or R-4 occupancy or within 10 feet of any part of a R-1, R-2 or R-4 occupancy
or on or under any portion of the structure of a R-1, R-2 or R-4 6ccupancy.

+ 308.1.4.2. It is unlawful for any person to own or manage R-1, R-2 or R-4 occupancy without
installing and maintaining on each balcony and patio of each dwelling unit and guest room
approved signage readily visible to the occupants prohibiting the use of any barbecue grill, hibachi
or smoker.

-11-



&

308.1.4.3. It is unlawful for any person to own or manage an R-1, R-2 or R-4 occupancy that is
designed without patios or balconies without installing and maintaining approved signage in each
separate common area.
308.1.4.4. It is unlawful for any person to own or manage an R-1, R-2 or R-4 occupancy without
maintaining written proof, available to City of Irving inspectors upon request, that approved
signage has been installed on each balcony and patio of every dwelling unit and guest room. Such
proof may be in the form of a lease addendum in which the tenant acknowledges that such signage
exists, by picture or by other means that would prove that the signage exists. -

308.1.4.5. It is unlawful for any person to own or manage an R-1, R-2 or R-4 occupancy without
notifying each tenant in writing as part of their lease or as an addendum to their lease at the time
the tenant moves in, that such signage exists and must be maintained in place.

Section 308.1.6.3. Section 308.1.6.3 of Section 308 “Open Flames” of Chapter 3 “General
Requirements” of this code is amended to read as follows:

308.1.6.3 Sky lanterns. A person shall not release or cause to be released a sky lantem

Section 311.5. Section 311.5 of Section 31 1 “Vacant Premises” of Chapter 3 “General Requrrements”
of thrs code is amended to read as follows:

311.5 Placards. The fire code official is-authorized to reqnire marking of any vacant or abandoned
buildings or structures determined to be unsafe pursuant to Section 110 of this code relating to
structural or interior hazards, as required by Section 311.5.1 through 311.5.5.

Section 401.3.Section 401.3 of Section 401 “General” of Chapter 4 “Emergency Planmng And
Preparedness” of this code is amended to read as follows:

401.3 Emergency responder notification Notification of emergency responders shall be in
accordance with Sections 401.3.1 through 401.3 4.

Section 401.3.1. Section 401.3.1 of Section 401 “General” of Chapter 4 “Emergency Planning And
Preparedness” of this code is amended to read as follows:

401.3.1 Fire events. In the event of a fire, the discovery of smoke from an unauthorized or
unidentified source, or any situation that would indicate a hazard occurs on property, the owner or

occupant shall immediately report such conditions to the fire department

Section 401. Section 401 “General” of Chapter 4 “Emergency Planmng And Preparedness” of this
code is amended by adding Section 401.3.4 to read as follows:

401.3.4 False alarms and nuisance alarms. False alarms and nuisance alarms shall not be grven
signaled, or transmitted or caused or permitted to be given, signaled, or transmitted in any manner.

Section 401.5 of Section 401 “General” of Chapter 4 “Emergency Planmng And Preparedness” of
this code is amended to read as follows:

401.5 Making false report. It shall be unlawful for a person to give, signal, transmit, or cause t0 be
transmitted a false alarm. :

-12-



-~

Section 403. -Section 403 “Emergency Preparedness Requirements” of Chapter 4 “Emergency
Planning And Preparedness” of this code is amended by adding Section 403.1.1 to read as follows:

403.1.1 Drill frequency. Emergency evacuation drills shall be conducted at least 12 times per year,
4 times per year on each shift. Twelve drills shall be conducted in the first year of operation. Drills
are not required to comply with the time requirements of Section 405.4.

Section 403.10.3.4. Section 403.10.3.4 of Section 403 “Emergency Preparedness Requirements” of
Chapter 4 “Emergency Planning And Preparedness” of this code is amended to read as follows:

403.10.3.4 Drill frequency. Emergency evacuation drills shall be conducted at least 12 times per
year, 4 times per year on each shift. Twelve drills shall be conducted in the first year of operation.
Drills are not required to comply with the time requirements of Section 405.4.

Section 404. Section 404 “Fire Safety and Evacuation Plans” of Chapter 4 “Emergency Planning And
Preparedness” of this code is amended by deleting Section 404.2.2 “Fire safety plans.”

Section 405. Section 405 “Emergency Evacuation Drills” of Chapter 4 “Emergency Planning And
Preparedness” of this code is amended by adding Section 405.1.1 to read as follows:

405.1.1 Fire department personnel required to witness drills. Fire department personnel shall be
present, and witness, emergency evacuation drills conducted by educatlonal occupancies on the basis
of at least one emergency evacuation drill per semester.

Section 501.4. Section 501.4 of Section 501 “General” of Chapter 5 “Fire Service Features” of this
code is amended to read as follows:

501.4 Timing of installation. When fire apparatus access roads or a water supply for fire protection '
is required to be installed for any structure or development, they shall be installed, tested and
approved prior to the time of which construction has progressed beyond completion of the foundation
of any structure. '

Section 502.1. Section 502.1 of Section 502 “Definitions” of Chapter 5 “Fire Service Features” of
this code is amended by adding the following definitions:

CONTROLLED ACCESS GATE. A device located on public or private property which controls or
restricts access by motor vehicles or persons or both. The term includes, but is not limited to, metal or
wooden swing railings, metal or wooden rolling or sliding railings and drop arm type railings extending
across public or private streets or fire lanes whether manually operated or motorized. .

LIGHT DUTY METAL CHAIN. A chain with metal links no larger than Y-inch in diameter. This
term does not include high test proof coil chains or other heat tempered chains of any size. ‘

OWNER. A natural person, corporation, partnershlp, assocratlon or any other similar entity who has
care, custody or control of the premlses .

MAIN GATE. A security gate located on public or private property where more than one security gate

exists and which has been designated in writing by the owner to the police department, fire department
and code enforcement as the main access to the property.

-13-



APPROVED PADLOCK A Knox padlock Wthh has been dual keyed for the Irving Fire and Police
Departments.

Section 503.1.1. Séption 503.1.1 of Section 503 “Fire Apparatus Access Roads” of Chapter 5 “Fire
Service Features” of this code is amended to read as follows:

503.1.1 Buildings and facilities. Approved fire apparatus access roads shall be provided for every
facility, building or portion of a building hereafter constructed or moved into or within the
jurisdiction. The fire apparatus access road shall comply with the requirements of this section and
shall extend to within 150 feet of all portions of the facility and all portions of the exterior wall of the
first story of the building as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the building or
facility. Except for single- or two-family residences, the path of measurement shall be along a
minimum of a 10 foot wide unobstructed pathway around the external walls of the structure. The
owner of the building or facility shall submit an 8-%” x 117 site plan showing the fire lanes and foot
print of the building to the fire department for approval prior to permits being issued for the building
or facility. Approved fire lane site plans shall be kept on file with the fire department. Any fire lane
that has been established prior to the adoption of this code, or that was established by separate
ordinance or approval of a fire lane site plan, is a fire lane for all intents_and‘ purposes and shall be
maintained as required by this code, whether or not it meets the minimum requirements of a fire lane.
In addition, the chief may designate a fire lane when the ingress or egress of a new or existing piece
of property is not adequate for fire department apparatus.

Exception: The fire code official is authorized to increase the dimension of 150 feet where:

. The building is equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2 or 903.3.1.3.

2. Fire apparatus access roads cannot be installed due to location on property, topography,
waterways, non-negotiable grades or other similar conditions, and an approved alternative
means of fire protection is provided.

3. There are not more than two Group R-3 or Group U occupancies.

Section 503.2. Section 503.2 of Section 503 “Fire Apparatus Access Roads” of Chapter 5 “Fire
Service Features” of this code is amended to read as follows:

503.2 Specifications. Fire apparatus access roads shall be installed and arranged in accordance with
Sections 503.2.1 through 503.2.8 and Appendix D, as amended.

Section 503.2.1. Section 503.2.1 of Section 503 “Fire Apparatus Access Roads” of Chapter 5 “Fire
Service Features” of this code is amended to read as follows:

503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not less than
24 feet, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an unobstructed

vertical clearance of not less than 14 feet.

Section 503.2.2. Section 503.2.2 of Section 503 “Fire Apparatus Access Roads” of Chapter 5 “Fire
Service Features” of this code is amended to read as follows: v

-14-



503.2.2 Authority. The fire code official shall have the authority to require an increase in the
minimum access widths and vertical clearances where they are 1nadequate for fire or rescue
operations.

Section 503.3. Section 503 3 of Section 503 “Fire Apparatus Access Roads” of Chapter 5 “Fire
Service Features” of thlS code is amended to read as follows:

503.3 Marking.'Approved striping or, when allowed by the fire code official, signs, or‘both, shall be.

provided for fire apparatus access roads to identify such roads or prohibit the obstruction thereof.

Signs and striping shall be maintained .in a clean and leglble condition at all trmes and shall be
-replaced or repaired when necessary to provrde adequate visibility.

1. Striping — Fire apparatus access roads shall be marked by pamted lines of red traffic paint 6 inches
in width to show the boundaries of the lane. The words “NO PARKING FIRE LANE” or "FIRE
LANE NO PARKING?” shall appear in 4 inch white letters at 25 foot intervals on the red border
markings along both sides of the fire lanes. Where a curb is available, the stripping shall be on
the vertical face of the curb or on the horizontal road surface 1mmed1ately adJacent to the curb.

2. Signs — Signs shall read “NO PARKING FIRE LANE” or "FIRE LANE NO PARKING" and
shall be 12 inches wide and 18 inches high. Signs shall be painted on a white background with
letters and borders in red, using not less than 2 inch lettering. Signs shall be permanently affixed
to a stationary post and the bottom of the sign shall be 6 feet, 6 inches above finished grade. Signs
shall be spaced not more than 50 feet apart along both sides of the fire lane. Signs may be installed
on permanent buildings or walls or as approved by the fire code official.

Section 503.4. Section 503.4 of Section 503 “Fire Apparatus Access Roads” of Chapter 5 “Fire
Service Features™ of this code is amended to read as follows:

503.4 O_bstruction of fire apparatus access roads. Fire apparatus access roads shall not be obstructed
in any manner, including the parking of vehicles. The minimum widths and clearances established in
Section 503.2.1 and any area marked as a fire lane as.described in Section 503.3 shall be maintained
at all times. It is unlawful for any person to park, stop, or leave standing any non-emergency vehicle
within any area specifically designated as a fire apparatus access road. The owner or person in control
of the property upon which a fire apparatus access road exists shall cause any motor vehicle, other
than an authorized emergency vehicle; that is parked in the fire lane to be removed in compliance with _
applicable laws. It is an affirmative defense to. this section that written approval has been obtained
from the fire department for closure-of .one-half the wrdth of the fire apparatus access road while
repairing the. surface of the road. -

Exception: An approved controlled access gate meetmg all the requlrements of all applicable
city codes. -

Sectlon 503.6. Section 503.6 of Section 503 “Fire Apparatus Access Roads” of Chapter 5 “Fire
Service Features of thls code is amended to read as follows

503.6 Controlled access gates. It is unlawful for any owner or other person in control of public or

private property-to have a controlled access gate located on or restricting access to his or her property
unless the gate is in comphance with the followmg

-15-



. Gates consisting of a single wooden railing that pivots vertically to allow passage of vehicles shall
be so constructed and maintained to break away on minor impact or on application of manual
pressure at the end most remote from the pivot point. The wooden railings shall be of soft wood
and mounted on the pivot point with a knife edge bracket or otherwise scored to create a weak
point that will break away when pressure is applied. The opening motors shall be connected to
an approved radio receiver as described in Item 5 below.

. Horizontal swinging gates shall open manually using an approved padlock. Each gate shall have
a pin that has the capability of being secured with the approved padlock installed on the end of
the operating arm closest to the gate. If no operating arms are installed, then a light duty metal
chain and approved padlock shall be used to secure the gate. If provided, the opening motors of
each gate shall be connected to an approved radio receiver as described in #5 below.

. Rolling or sliding type gates shall not be installed in residential communities. Rolling or sliding
type gates shall have an approved locking box mounted on the gate. The box shall open from
both sides of the gate. This box shall be painted red and the word “FIRE” shall be lettered on the
exterior of the box. There shall be a T-type handle attached to a cable release inside the box.
When pulled, the cable shall disengage all opening mechanisms allowing the gate to be opened
manually. This box shall be secured with an approved padlock. The opening motors of each gate
shall be connected to an approved radio receiver as described in Item 5 below. '

Exception: One- and two-family dwellings.

. Personnel gates required for emergency access shall be equipped with an access door no smaller
than 18” x 18 that is secured by an approved padlock. The inside latching mechanism shall not
be more than 12 inches from the edge of the access door. If the personnel gate is for-emergency
use only, the door may be secured with an approved padlock accessible from both sides of the
gate and no other latching hardware.

. All motorized gates shall be equipped with an approved radio receiver and related equipmeént as
follows:

a. A 6 channel minimum modular receiver with an external antenna that has a frequency
approved by the code official. Each digital channel module shall be preset to a specific digital
code approved by the code official.

b. The receiver shall be equipped with an external, weatherproof antenna assembly.

c. The antenna shall be located so that it will receive a clear signal from the transmitter when
operated from inside a vehicle at a distance of at least 30 feet from the gate.

d. The signal from the receiver to the operating motor shall override all other opening systems.

e. The receiver shall be protected from weather and physical damage.

f. The receiver shall be connected to an external wall mounted lamp assembly that is located at
each gate. The lamp assembly shall be visible to all approaching vehicle traffic and equipped

with a red globe and flasher wired so that the bulb flashes when the gate has been opened by
the radio receiver.

-16-






